
A SPECIAL WELCOME TO 
CELEBRATE THE OPENING OF  

OUR NEWEST EYECARE CENTER 

A Complete Pair Of
Eyeglasses Or Rx Sunglasses

50% 
OFF

Coupon required at time of purchase. Save 50% off a 
complete pair (frame and lenses) of prescription eyeglasses 
or prescription sunglasses. Valid prescription required. 
Cannot be combined with vision care or insurance plans/
benefits. Excludes Michael Kors. Not valid on previous 
purchases, contact lenses, accessories, readers, or non-
prescription sunglasses. Discount off tag price. Savings 
applied to lenses. Valid only at the Pearle Vision at the 
Arboretum at South Barrington. Taxes not included. See 
store for details. Limit one coupon per customer. No cash 
value. Offer ends: 9/2/2019. Discount Code: 754444. ©2019 
Pearle Vision. All Rights Reserved.

Receive an eye exam from any eye care professional within 
the past 90 days and receive a discount equal to your out-
of-pocket or co-pay expense on the purchase of a complete 
pair (frame and lenses). May be combined with any vision 
care or insurance plans/benefits, any store offer or discount. 
Not valid on previous purchases, contact lenses, accessories, 
readers, or non-prescription sunglasses. Excludes Michael 
Kors. Discount off tag price. Savings applied to lenses. Valid 
eyeglass purchase required. Valid eye exam receipt required. 
Valid at Pearle Vision at the Arboretum at South Barrington. 
Taxes not included. See store for details. Limit one coupon 
per customer. No cash value. Offer ends 9/2/2019. Discount 
Code: 755944. ©2019 Pearle Vision. All Rights Reserved. 

PLUS

WE’LL COVER
THE COST

OF YOUR

EYE EXAM

We Work With All Major Health And Vision Plans Including
We Work With All Major Health 

And Vision Plans Including

Valid Only At Pearle Vision South Barrington (At The Arboretum)
Located Next To Xsport Fitness

100 West Higgins Road. South Barrington, IL. 60010  |  847-851-1046


